
FALL RIVER COUNTY MINUTES OF JANUARY 16, 2018 

 

 The Fall River Board of County Commissioners met in regular session on January 16, 2018 

at the South Annex. Present: Ann Abbott, Joe Allen, Joe Falkenburg, Paul Nabholz, Deb Russell 

and Sue Ganje, Auditor. 

 

 The Pledge of Allegiance was stated and the meeting called to order at 9:00 a.m. 

 

 The agenda was reviewed for conflicts; none were noted. ALL MOTIONS RECORDED IN 

THESE MINUTES WERE PASSED BY UNANIMOUS VOTE, UNLESS OTHERWISE 

STATED. 

 

 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Nabholz, to approve the agenda as written. 

 

 Motion made by Nabholz, seconded by Russell, to approve the minutes of January 16, 2018. 

   

 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Allen, to approve the December 31, 2017 Auditor’s 

Account with the Treasurer as follows: 

 

AUDITOR’S ACCOUNT WITH THE COUNTY TREASURER 

TO THE HONORABLE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF FALL RIVER 

COUNTY: 

  

I hereby submit the following report of my examination of the cash and cash items in the hands of 

the County Treasurer of this County on this 30
th

 day of November, 2017. 

   

 

Total Amt of Deposit in First Interstate Bank:  $1,063,317.98 

     

Total Amt of Deposit in First National Bank of Lead: $1,000.00 

 

Total Amount of Cash:     $1,808.16 

 

Total Amount of Treasurer’s Change Fund:   $900.00 

        

Total Amount of Checks in Treasurer’s  

Possession Not Exceeding Three Days:   $51,076.78 

      

 SAVINGS:  

 First Interstate Bank:     $206,538.05 

 First National Bank of Lead:    $2,005,208.64 

     

CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT: 

 First Interstate-Hot Springs:    $3,658,361.80 



 Black Hills Federal Credit Union:   $250,000.00 

 Bank of the West     $500,000.00 

 

Itemized list of all items, checks and drafts that have been in the Treasurer’s possession over three 

days: 

 Register of Deeds Change Fund: $500.00 

 Highway Petty Cash: $20.00 

 Election Petty Cash: $15.00 

 

RETURNED CHECKS:                        

Nichols, Sharyl – $77.70, 11/17/2017 

 

       TOTAL $7,738,644.11 

   

Dated This 30
th

 Day of November, 2017. 

 

/s/Sue Ganje, County Auditor of Fall River County 

 

County Monies: $7,215,668.10 

Held for other Entities: $343,310.23 

Held in Trust: $179,665.78 

 TOTAL: $7,738,644.11 

 

The Above Balance Reflects County Monies, Monies Held in Trust, and Monies Collected for and 

to be remitted to Other ENTITIES: SCHOOLS, TOWNS, TOWNSHIPS, FIRE, AMBULANCE 

AND ROAD DISTRICTS, AND THE STATE. 

 

 No county assistance or burial applications were submitted for action.  

 

 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Nabholz, to approve the following resolution: 

 

FALL RIVER COUNTY RESOLUTION #2018-03 

 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to SDCL 12-15-11, the Board of County Commissioners at their first 

meeting shall set a fee for Election Board and the mileage rate; 

  

 NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Fall River County Board of 

Commissioners have set the FLAT FEE FOR ATTENDANCE OF ELECTION SCHOOL AT 

$15.00; and  

  

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Fall River Board of County Commissioners has set 

the fee for Election Boards for the Primary and General and all Special Elections as follows: 

 

 ALL ELECTION BOARDS WILL RECEIVE A FLAT FEE OF $115.00; RESOLUTION 

AND ABSENTEE BOARDS WILL BE SET AT $8.55 PER HOUR, and 

  

 ALL PROVISIONAL BOARDS WILL BE SET AT A $20.00 FLAT FEE, and 

 



 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Fall River County Commissioners set the mileage 

rate at $.42 per mile for the transporting of ballots and ballot boxes by the precinct superintendent. 

  

 Dated this 16
th

 day of January, 2018. 

 

       /s/Joe Falkenburg, Chairman 

       Fall River Board of County Commissioners 

ATTEST: 

 

/s/Sue Ganje, County Auditor, Fall River County 

 
 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Abbott, to approve the agreement between Fall River 

County and the South Dakota Public Assurance Alliance. 

 

 Susie Simkins, Director of Equalization and John McBride, Andersen Engineers, met with 

the board about the first reading of the section line ROW ordinance. McBride stated that they had 

recently gone to training and noted changes that he is now currently aware of. He asked the board to 

table this for an amended version. The board will revisit a first reading on the amended ordinance at 

the February 6, 2018 meeting. 

 

 Frank Maynard, Emergency Management, met with the board. Motion made by Russell, 

seconded by Nabholz, to approve the list of 2018 volunteers, as is on file at the auditor’s office. 

 

 Motion made by Abbott, seconded by Allen, to authorize Maynard to proceed with 2017 

Homeland Security Grant and purchase a trailer and UTV tracks to be paid by the county, and then 

reimbursed by the state. 

 

 Motion made by Allen, seconded by Russell, to approve Maynard to proceed with the court 

security grant, to be paid by county, and then reimbursed for 50% of the expenses by the state. 

 

 Maynard reported fire incidents and gave updates on generator HLS funds. 

 

 Lyle Jensen, Building Supervisor, met with the board to present a quote for a keypad to lock 

the meeting room door at the South Annex in the amount of $4,471.67. Jensen will bring back to the 

next meeting with it listed as the meeting room door rather than the security door on the agenda.   

 

 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Nabholz, to approve an Enterprise Bandwith Master 

Service Agreement quote from Golden West for the courthouse, in the amount of $895.00 per 

month. This is to replace the current agreement which is at a monthly cost of $1,277.00.   

 

 Discussion was held on insuring a generator. Motion made by Nabholz, seconded by 

Russell, to add coverage to insure the South Annex generator, with a value of $20,000.00. 

  

 Motion made by Abbott, seconded by Russell, to approve the quote for a steam coil for the 

jail air handler, to be delivered in three weeks, in the amount of $2,040.00, which includes freight. 

 



 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Abbott, to approve a quote for a new sign and the 

street number for the Director of Equalization in the amounts of $539.00 and to change the 

Veteran’s Service Officer Sign to Emergency Management in the amount of $167.00. 

  

 Dan Cullen, Veteran’s Service Officer, met with the board, to give his quarterly report. 

 

 Bob Evans, Sheriff, met with the board. Motion made by Nabholz, seconded by Allen, to 

approve the hiring of Michael DeBoer, jailer, at $12.50 per hour, as per union contract, effective 

January 3, 2018. 

 

 Sue Ganje, Auditor, brought back to the board a section of the proposed Fall River County 

Poor Relief Guidelines for review. Allen questioned if assistance applicants could meet in a setting 

that offered privacy, Russell noted that she did not believe state law allowed this. The commission 

addressed areas the auditor requested.  

 

 Randy Seiler, Highway Superintendent, met with the board. The board reviewed fuel and 

propane bids as follows: 

    1-8-18      1-12-18 

    8000 Gallons #1/#2 Diesel blend  Propane 

Nelson’s   $2.40/gallon     1.49/gallon 

CBH COOP   No Bid      No bid 

Dakota Propane  No Bid      No bid 

MG Oil Company  No Bid      No bid 

Bill Tanner Fuel   No Bid      No bid 

 

 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Abbott, to accept the low and only bid from Nelson’s 

Oil and Gas, Inc for 8000 gallons #1/#2 diesel blend at $2.40 per gallon and propane at $1.49 per 

gallon. 

 

 Motion made by Allen, seconded by Russell to approve travel for Seiler to attend the short 

course training in Deadwood, March 20 and March 21, 2018. The board asked that Seiler come 

back with a report. 

 

 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Allen, to set a hearing for chip sealing on the 2018 

projects. Bids will be publicly opened on February 20, 2018 at 10:15 a.m. The deadline to receive 

the bids for chip sealing will be February 15, 2018 at 10:00 a.m. This will allow time for the 

highway superintendant and engineer’s to review bids for compliance. 

 

 Chip sealing on old Highway 18 in 2018 was briefly discussed, with the board asking Seiler 

to hold off until things are settled on that road.  

 

 Motion made by Abbott, seconded by Russell, to approve bills as follows: 

 

GENERAL FUND 
    AUDRA HILL CONSULTING,INC MI QMHP EVALUATION $362.92 

  A'VIANDS LLC  INMATE MEALS $29,135.00 

  A-Z SHREDDING INC SHREDDING $84.60 



  BEESLEY LAW OFFICE CAAF $5,700.48 

  BLACK HILLS CHEMICAL SUPPLY $517.84 

  BOYS AND GIRLS CLUB BH 2018 BUDGETED ALLOTMENT $7,500.00 

  CENTURY BUSINESS LEASING COPIER LEASE & METER $396.40 

  CHRIS SUPPLY SUPPLY $11.79 

  COLBATH, ANGELA M CAAF $2,311.7 

  DAVIS, JEREMIAH CAAF $316.80 

  DEAN SCHAEFER COURT REP COURT REPORTER $30.00 

  DEMERSSEMAN JENSEN CAAF $3,751.60 

  EDGEMONT YMCA 2018 BUDGETED ALLOTMENT $1,000.00 

  EDGEMONT SENIOR CITIZENS 2018 BUDGETED ALLOTMENT $3,000.00 

  EN-TECH LLC FUMIGATION $110.00 

  FALL RIVER CLINIC INMATE MEDICAL $509.60 

  FALL RIVER HEALTH SERVICE INMATE MEDICAL $4,398.81 

  FARRELL,FARRELL &GINSBACH CAAF $164.50 

  FALL RIVER COUNTY HERALD PUBLICATION $1,267.41 

  FALL RIVER CTY TREASURER MH TAXES $168.23 

  GOFF, GARLAND LEE CAAF $6,632.81 

  GOLDEN WEST TECHNOLOGIES TECH SUPPORT $499.35 

  GREY &EISENBRAUN PROF.LLC CAAF $1,569.80 

  HARRIS, BETSEY CAAF $3,622.50 

  HEARTLAND PAPER COMPANY PARTS $109.65 

  HOBART SALES & SERVICE SERVICE $1,056.90 

  HOT SPRINGS ACE HARDWARE SUPPLY $332.56 

  HOT SPRINGS AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLIES $9.48 

  HOT SPRINGS PUBLIC LIBRAY 2018 BUDGETED ALLOTMENT $20,000.00 

  KATTERHAGEN, MARK MENTAL ILLNESS $15.00 

  LEWIS & CLARK BEHAVIORAL MI $160.00 

  LEWNO, LUCY MENTAL ILLNESS $150.46 

  LIBERTY CHRYSLER CENTER VEHICLE MAINTENANCE $64.30 

  LOCKWOOD, DARCY MENTAL ILLNESS $15.00 

  LYNN'S DAK. MART PHARMACY  INMATE PHARMACY $292.31 

  MCLEODS OFFICE SUPPLY CO. TOWNSHIP BOOKS $63.23 

  MEDICAL WASTE TRANSPORT MEDICAL WASTE $192.64 

  NORTON'S SINCLAIR REPAIR/MAINTENANCE $70.00 

  OELRICHS COMMUNITY CENTER 2018 BUDGETED ALLOTMENT $1,500.00 

  O'NEILL, JUSTIN CAAF $1,405.96 

  PENNINGTON COUNTY JAIL INMATE HOUSING PENNINGTON $2,625.00 

  QUILL CORPORATION SUPPLIES $1,118.53 

  RADIOLOGY ASSOCIATES INMATE MEDICAL $176.40 

  RAPID CITY JOURNAL (THE) PUBLICATION $1,797.15 

  SOUTHERN HILLS ECONOMIC 2018 BUDGETED ALLOTMENT $6,000.00 

  SD DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE BLOOD DRAW $70.00 

  SDSU WEST RIVER AG CENTER MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT $58.78 



  SERVALL RUGS/MATS/UNIFORMS $338.90 

  SKINNER, MATTHEW L. PC  CAAF $8,396.80 

  SPITZER CONSTRUCTION INC SNOW REMOVAL $2,500.00 

  SPITZER, KRISTI TRAVEL REIMBURSEMENT $43.00 

  SPOT WRANGLERS SERVICE CONTRACT $550.00 

  STATE SUPPLY SUPPLY $258.08 

  STEPHENS LAW OFFICE CAAF $1,030.00 

  STEVENS, MIKAYLA BLOOD DRAW $150.00 

  TWILIGHT INC FIRST AID SUPPLY $199.02 

  WEED & PEST CONFERENCE 2018 WEED & PEST CONTRACT $300.00 

  SIDES, JOHN JURY FEE $451.20 

  YANKTON CO. SHERIFF PAPERS SERVED $50.00 

  YANKTON CO TREASURER MI $118.75 

  JURY FEES FIRST QUARTER $6,075.82 

  WITNESS FEES FIRST QUARTER $40.84 

                                                                          TOTAL FOR GENERAL FUND  $130,847.90 

COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE 
    BROSZ ENGINEERING, INC. PROJECT PLANNING/TESTING $2,975.00 

  FORWARD DISTRIBUTING PARTS/SUPPLY $203.40 

  POWERPLAN BF PARTS $425.72 

  RAPID DELIVERY   DELIVERY $35.36 

  SEILER, RANDY CELL REIMBURSMENT $75.00 

 
TOTAL FOR COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE $3,714.48 

911 SURCHARGE REIMBURSMENT 
    CENTURY LINK DISPATCH TRANSFER/911 DISPATCH INCOMING $596.49 

 
TOTAL FOR 911 SURCHARGE REIMBURSMENT $596.49 

EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT 
    FALL RIVER COUNTY HERALD PUBLICATION $40.92 

  HOT SPRINGS AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLIES $39.99 

  RAPID CHEVROLET CADILLAC VEHICLE MAINTENANCE $56.15 

  RAPID CITY JOURNAL (THE) PUBLICATION $37.58 

 
TOTALS FOR EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT $174.64 

24/7 SOBRIETY FUND 
    GEN DIAGNOSTICS INC 24/7 SUPPLIES $2,076.50 

  INTOXIMETERS 24/7 SUPPLIES $975.00 

 
TOTALS FOR 24/7 SOBRIETY FUND $3,051.50 

COURTHOUSE BUILDING FUND 
    CHRISTENSEN ELECTRIC, LLC ELECTRICIAN $5,348.42 

  GOLDEN WEST TECHNOLOGIES SERVICE $1,272.82 

  HOT SPRINGS ACE HARDWARE SUPPLY $631.10 

  SPOT WRANGLERS SERVICE CONTRACT $2,235.00 

 
TOTAL FOR COURTHOUSE BUILDING FUND $9,487.34 

 
TOTAL PAID BETWEEN  1/3/18 AND 1/16/18 $147,872.35 

 



 Break was taken at 10:07 a.m. Meeting resumed at 10:15 a.m. 

 

 Public comment was heard from Paul Nabholz and Jim Angell. Nabholz advised he has sent 

out an email to 174 Power Global to get further information for a better estimate on revenues. 

Nabholz sent an email to the State’s Attorney concerning the fox and costs could be a lien on the 

owner. Angell noted that he didn’t like certain comments that had been made during the 1-3-18 

meeting on the Chilson Bridge. 

 

 Falkenburg opened public comment and discussion on the Chilson Bridge, asking for one or 

two residents in the area to be spokesman for the group so the auditor can let people know when the 

Chilson Bridge is on the agenda to keep them informed. Discussion was held on use of eminent 

domain, project timeline, appraisals and negotiations, evaluation of costs, hiring outside attorneys, 

and information on the history of the road purchase for the bridge, bridge grants and letters to 

representatives expressing concerns. 

  

 Joe Allen left the meeting at 11:07 a.m. 

 

 The board received a document of SD Game Fish and Park’s activities for 2017. Falkenburg 

has questions on the amount paid by the county to the state on predator control (wildlife damage 

management), and asked the Auditor to try to get Keith Fisk from GF&P to a future meeting.  

 

 Paul Nabholz, Commissioner, spoke of tracking the equipment in the Highway Department 

by GPS. There are possibilities to do this through Caterpillar or Verizon. This may help when 

commissioners get phone calls at home so they can see the progress during storms, etc. Seiler spoke 

of daily forms operators fill out on what roads they work on, machine costs etc, but expressed 

caution on giving time estimates to landowners for road graders to arrive during emergency snow 

removal due to possibilities of pulling graders from road to road as needed, breakdowns and other 

issues encountered. Other commissioners noted either no need for the tracking, or it could be 

considered if there are problems, no comments to pursue.  

 

 George Kotti, Hot Springs Mayor; Dawn Johnson, Hot Springs Librarian and Kim Barbieri, 

City Administrator, met with the board to discuss Prairie Hills Transit. Kotti spoke of the 

responsibilities and needs the council considered for their upcoming budget, as commissioners did 

for their budget. There are several big projects coming up in the City of Hot Springs over the course 

of the next few years and there are limited funds for outside organizations. The funding of non-

profit organizations is a question. Kotti also noted their offer for a bus garage, land and utilities to 

PHT. The embezzlement issue within PHT was discussed. Kotti encouraged citizens to use United 

Way and Prairie Hills Transit to do fundraising to make up the difference. 

 

Funding for the HS Library by users in the county was also discussed. Falkenburg asked to 

meet with the City to continue working on the solution for public transportation. Librarian Dawn 

Johnson updated the board regarding their recent award of being in the top 15
 
libraries in the nation 

in the budget area, noting staff’s positive attitudes, membership and patronage.  

 

 Motion made by Russell, seconded by Nabholz, to adjourn the meeting at 11:20 a.m. 

 

          /s/ Joe Falkenburg 

          Joe Falkenburg, Chair 



Board of Fall River County Commissioners 

ATTEST: 

/s/ Sue Ganje 

Sue Ganje, Fall River County Auditor 


